
Chemical Unit
Size

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended
Price

Unit Price Extended
Price

Unit Price Extended
Price

78% Sulfuric Acid NSF
Ton (2,200

gallons
116 tons  $              494.60  $                 57,373.60 

Copper Sulfate AWWA #B602 - 
17

50 lb. bag
25 bags  $          197.50  $            4,937.50 F30 - $132.50

Med - $177.50
Large $185.00

$3312.50
$4437.50
$4625.00

Sodium Silica Fluoride AWWA 
#B702

50 lb. bag 876 bags  $            76.33  $          66,865.08 $1.5485  $          74,762.73 $ 82.30 $ 72,094.80 $ 76.99 $ 67,443.24

Exceptions:

26114-A 78% Sulfuic Acid NSF, Copper Sulfate, and Sodium Silica Fluoride

Tally Sheet

25 bags all at one time for delivery

No bid No bid No bid

55.12 lb bag1. Copper Sulfate - $3.95/lb 
50lbs/bag 25 bag min
*valid 60 days only
2. Sodium Silica Fluorid - 
$1.385/lb (55.115 lb/bag)
40 bags/pallet
16 pallets minimum

No bid

No bid

No bid No bid No bid

Estimated
Annual 

Quantity

The Dycho Company, Inc. Specialty Chemical 
Company LLC

Brenntag Southeast, Inc. Chemrite, Incorporated Southern States Chemical
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